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MobilSense Technologies, Inc. shortlisted for 20 Most 
Promising Enterprise Mobility Solution Providers 2016 Ranking 

by CIOReview 
 

FREMONT, CA (Jun 28, 2016) - We are pleased to announce that MobilSense 
Technologies, was chosen among the 20 Most Promising Enterprise Mobility 
Solution Providers 2016 by CIOReview. 
 
CIOReview selected MobilSense Technologies as one of the 20 Most Promising 
Enterprise Mobility Solution Providers of 2016 based on the company’s specialties 
in providing mobile expense management solutions for medium to large size 
businesses. Its recently launched MobilSentryDIYTM is the industry’s first automated 
Mobile Expense Management (MEM) solution for the Midmarket. This 
revolutionary, self-service packaging provides midsize companies with a long-
awaited capability that delivers powerful analytics and optimization technology in 
a unique ROI-based pricing model favoring Midsize budgets.  MobilSense offers a 
full suite of solutions in the areas of invoice optimization, cost allocation 
management, online provisioning, help desk, visibility and reporting, and employee 
accountability.   
 
“The companies selected for our 20 Most Promising Enterprise Mobility Solution 
Providers 2016 list are an elite group of companies whose products and solutions 
are changing their respective industries,” said Jeevan George, Managing Editor of 
CIOReview. “We are proud to feature MobilSense Technologies, Inc. in this edition 
for its range of revolutionary solutions that is setting a new benchmark in the 
enterprise mobility arena.” 
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About MobilSense Technologies, Inc. 

 
MobilSense Technologies Inc, based in Agoura Hills, CA was founded in 2001 to 
deliver a premier wireless management solution.  Focused on serving the 
enterprise wireless management needs, MobilSense combines vision, technology 
and experience to deliver a fully automated solution.  MobilSense believes in 
empowering the enterprise with technology based automation for repeatable 
business processes and bringing the best mix of automation and human processes 
to manage and control wireless assets.   
 
For additional information visit MobilSense http://www.mobilsense.com or call 
888.870.4250. 
 
About CIOReview 

 

Published from Fremont, California, CIOReview is a print magazine that explores 
and understands the plethora of ways adopted by firms to execute the smooth 
functioning of their businesses. A distinguished panel comprised of CEOs, CIOs, IT 
VPs including CIOReview’s editorial board finalized the “20 Most Promising 
Enterprise Mobility Solution Providers 2016” in the U.S. and shortlisted the best 
vendors and consultants. For more info: http://www.cioreview.com  
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